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RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
 
Approve Amendment No. 1 to the Professional Services Agreement with NAI 
Consulting in the amount of $77,100 for project management and contract 
administrative support services.  
 
EXECUTIVE SUMMARY: 
 

 The City relies on NAI Consulting as staff augmentation for Capital 
Improvement Program (CIP) project management and administrative support 
services. 
 

 Due to a higher than normal work volume, an increase in the current contract 
limit is necessary in order to complete the design phase of projects 
scheduled for bidding this spring.   
 

 Amendment No. 1 (Attachment 1) will add an additional $77,100 to provide 
needed services for the remainder of the fiscal year.   

 
FISCAL IMPACT: 
 
No additional appropriation is necessary since individual project management 
budgets are approved for each individual CIP project when Council annually 
approves the CIP Plan.  
 
BACKGROUND/ANALYSIS:  
 
In order to efficiently design and administer the City’s capital projects, consultant 
staff extension services have been used for CIP project management and 
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administrative support since 1997.  This year has been particularly busy for the CIP 
including high priority paving and drainage projects that caused higher than normal 
project management expenditures in the beginning of the fiscal year.  As in years 
past, NAI Consulting has provided excellent support on these projects; however, 
due to the higher than normal volume of work, an increase in the contract limit is 
necessary in order to complete the design phase of projects scheduled for bidding 
this spring.  Staff therefore recommends amending NAI Consulting’s contract 
authority so that their services will be available through June 2015.   
 
ALTERNATIVES: 
 
For continuity of project management, staff does not recommend an alternative 
action.   
 
Report prepared by:  Ed Wimmer, P.E., Principal Engineer 
Report approved for submission by:  Timothy R. Jonasson, P.E. 

       Public Works Director/City Engineer 
 

Attachment:  1.  Amendment No. 1 
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